Event Details

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 1
Event Round Version

1 5

Event Name

Fi ngerprinting Services

Start Time Finish Time

12/ 31/ 2020 08:00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bid Number: 1

Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96

Event Description

An addendum has been posted to the Indiana Supplier Portal.

General Comments
- Addendum 02 posted January 29, 2021
General Questions

Bidder:

Submit To:

Contact:
Phone:
Email:

Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
296 Concord Road

Suite 300

Billerica MA 01821

United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Abigail Chittenden

AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov

[ Question UOM

Worst

Response

Please upload your completed Attachment A- Minority and
Women Subcontractor Commitment Form.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment Al- Indiana
Veteran Owned Small Business Subcontractor Commitment
form.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment C- Indiana
Economic Impact form.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment D- Cost
Proposal

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Contact:

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder:
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 2

Event Round Version

1 5

Event Name

Fi ngerprinting Services

Start Time Finish Time Submit To:
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency: US Dollar

Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email:

Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96

Response Comments

Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
296 Concord Road

Suite 300

Billerica MA 01821

United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Abigail Chittenden

AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov

Please upload your completed Attachment E- Business
Proposal.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment F- Technical
Proposal.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Executive Summary.
Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment K - Service
Level Agreements.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment S - Resource
Usage.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 3
Event Round Version

1 5

Event Name

Fi ngerprinting Services

Start Time Finish Time

12/ 31/ 2020 08:00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bid Number: 1

Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Bidder:

Submit To:

Contact:
Phone:
Email:

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments

Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
296 Concord Road

Suite 300

Billerica MA 01821

United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Abigail Chittenden

AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 4
Event Round Version

1 5

Event Name

Fi ngerprinting Services

Start Time Finish Time

12/ 31/ 2020 08:00: 00 EST

02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency:
Bids allowed in other currency:

Bid Number:
Bid Date:
Total Bid Amount:

US Dollar
No

1
02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST
2,224,504.96

Bidder:

Submit To:

Contact:
Phone:
Email:

Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
296 Concord Road

Suite 300

Billerica MA 01821

United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Abigail Chittenden

AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov

Line Details
No Bid:
Line: 1 Item ID: Line Qty: 194000 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 194000
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Standard Fingerprinting (including emergency placement services and hard copy services )
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 2 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description:  Out-of-State Fingerprinting
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 15
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 3 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description:

On-Site Mobile Fingerprinting: Groups of 29 or less applicants



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 5 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08:00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden

Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96

Question UoM Best Worst Response

What is your quote/bid price? 40

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid:
Line: 4 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: On-Site Mobile Fingerprinting: Groups of 30 - 74 applicants
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 5 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: On-Site Mobile Fingerprinting: Groups of 75 or more applicants
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 6 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
No Bid:
Line: 6 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Partner Locations Standard Fingerprinting (including all equipment, maintenance, integrations,
sighage and training)
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 7 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Partner Locations: Equipment
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 16616
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 8 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Partner Locations: Annual Maintenance Fees



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 7 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 1307
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 9 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Partner Locations: Training Webinar
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 942
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 10 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Partner Locations: Training On-Site
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 992

Required: Yes

Response Comments

Mandatory Response:

No




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 8 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
No Bid:
Line: 11  Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Hour Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Custom Programming: Technician
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 34.11
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 12 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Hour Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Custom Programming: Customer Support
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 34.11
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 13 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Hour Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Custom Programming: Programmer/Developer




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 9 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 130.21
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 14 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Hour Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Custom Programming: Program/Project Manager
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 119.78
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 15 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Partner Locations: Training Off-Site
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 942

Required: Yes

Response Comments

Mandatory Response:

No




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 10 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
No Bid:
Line: 16 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Equipment: Equipment Purchase
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 16616
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 17 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Equipment: Annual Maintenance Fees *After Year 1
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 1307
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 18 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 0
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Equipment: Equipment Lease



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 11 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08:00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15: 00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 19 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Equipment: Training Webinar
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 942
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 20 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: Equipment: Training On-Site
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 992
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 12 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
No Bid:

Line: 21 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1

Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Equipment: Training Off-Site

Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 942

Required:

Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 13 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08:00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15: 00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
Bidder Information
Firm Name:
Name: Signature: Date:
Phone #:. Fax #:
Street Address:
City & State: Zip Code:

Email:




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 14
Event Round Version

1 5

Event Name

Fi ngerprinting Services

Start Time Finish Time

12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency: US Dollar

Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bid Number: 1

Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST

Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96

Appendix C - Bid Responses

Bidder:

Submit To:

Contact:
Phone:
Email:

Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
296 Concord Road

Suite 300

Billerica MA 01821

United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Abigail Chittenden

AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov

General Questions

Question

Response

Please upload your completed Attachment A-
Minority and Women Subcontractor Commitment Form.

Please upload your completed Attachment Al-
Indiana Veteran Owned Small Business Subcontractor

Commitment form.

Please upload your completed Attachment C- Indiana

Economic Impact form.

Please upload your completed Attachment D- Cost

Proposal

Please upload your completed Attachment E-

Business Proposal.

Please upload your completed Attachment F-

Technical Proposal.

Please upload your completed Executive Summary.

Please upload your completed Attachment K -
Service Level Agreements.

Please upload your completed Attachment S -

Resource Usage.

Line Iltems
Line: 1 Item ID: Line Qty: 194000 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 194000
Total Line Bid Amount: 2182500
Description: Standard Fingerprinting (including emergency placement services and hard copy services )
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25
Line: 2 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:

Total Line Bid Amount:

15

Description:  Out-of-State Fingerprinting

Comment: Pl ease see

Question

our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal

Response

What is your quote/bid

price? 15



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 15 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15: 00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
Line: 3 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 40
Description: On-Site Mobile Fingerprinting: Groups of 29 or less applicants
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 40
Line: 4 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 11.25
Description: On-Site Mobile Fingerprinting: Groups of 30 - 74 applicants
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25
Line: 5 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 11.25
Description:  On-Site Mobile Fingerprinting: Groups of 75 or more applicants
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25
Line: 6 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 11.25
Description: Partner Locations Standard Fingerprinting (including all equipment, maintenance, integrations,
signage and training)
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 11.25
Line: 7 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 16616
Description: Partner Locations: Equipment
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 16616
Line: 8 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 1307
Description: Partner Locations: Annual Maintenance Fees

Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal

Question Response

What is your quote/bid price? 1307



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 16 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15: 00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
Line: 9 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 942
Description: Partner Locations: Training Webinar
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 942
Line: 10 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 992
Description: Partner Locations: Training On-Site
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 992
Line: 11  Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Hour Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 34.11
Description:  Custom Programming: Technician
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 34.11
Line: 12 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Hour Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 34.11
Description: Custom Programming: Customer Support
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 34.11
Line: 13 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Hour Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 130.21
Description: Custom Programming: Programmer/Developer
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 130.21
Line: 14  Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Hour Bid Qty:

Total Line Bid Amount: 119.78
Description: Custom Programming: Program/Project Manager
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal

Question Response

What is your quote/bid price? 119.78



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 17 296 Concord Road
Event Round Version Suite 300
1 5 Billerica MA 01821
Event Name United States
Fi ngerprinting Services
Start Time Finish Time Submit To: Administration
12/ 31/ 2020 08: 00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15: 00: 00 EST IDOA, Procurement Division
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
Event Currency: US Dollar INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Bids allowed in other currency: No United States
Contact: Abigail Chittenden
Bid Number: 1 Phone:
Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST Email: AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov
Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96
Line: 15 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Total Line Bid Amount: 942
Description: Partner Locations: Training Off-Site
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 942
Line: 16 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Total Line Bid Amount: 16616
Description: Equipment: Equipment Purchase
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 16616
Line: 17 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Total Line Bid Amount: 1307
Description: Equipment: Annual Maintenance Fees *After Year 1
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 1307
Line: 18 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 0
Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: Equipment: Equipment Lease
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Products: Equi pnent
Product Description: |DEM A does not offer a |easing option
Total Monthly Lease Cost: NA
Lease Details: e.g. termrequired
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Line: 19 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Total Line Bid Amount: 942
Description: Equipment: Training Webinar
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 942
Line: 20 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1

Total Line Bid Amount: 992
Description: Equipment: Training On-Site
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal

Question Response

What is your quote/bid price? 992



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page
00061- 0000066603 Sel | RFx 18
Event Round Version

1 5

Event Name

Fi ngerprinting Services

Start Time Finish Time

12/ 31/ 2020 08:00: 00 EST 02/ 26/ 2021 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bid Number: 1

Bid Date: 02/26/2021 13:54:00 EST

Total Bid Amount: 2,224,504.96

Line: 21 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each

Total Line Bid Amount: 942
Description: Equipment: Training Off-Site
Comment: Pl ease see our Attachnent D - Cost Proposal

Question Response

Bidder:

Submit To:

Contact:
Phone:
Email:

Idemia Identity & Security USALLC
296 Concord Road

Suite 300

Billerica MA 01821

United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Abigail Chittenden

AChittenden@idoa.IN.gov

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price? 942



